ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

IFB No. 20-35 Interior Renovations at Flinn & Kennedy Middle Schools

Due: Tuesday, April 28, 2020

Time: 2:00 PM

Painting Work -Base

Painting Work -Base

Flinn Portion of

Kennedy Portion of

Flinn Portion of

Kennedy Portion of

Painting Work -Base | Painting Work -Base Combined Bid-1st | Combined Bid-1st Combined Bid-2nd | Combined Bid-2nd Addendums Bid Bond Required

Vendor Name Bid Al - Flinn Bid A2 - Flinn Alt. Bid #1 - Flinn Alt. Bid #2 - Flinn Bid A3 - Kennedy Bid A4 - Kennedy | Alt. Bid #3 - Kennedy floor floor Total floor floor Total Received Received Documentation
|Executive Painting $208,480.00 $99,815.00 no bid $127,240.00 $175,590.00 $69,730.00 no bid $208,480.00 $175,590.00 $384,070.00 $99,815.00 $69,730.00 $169,545.00 Y Y Y
Benchmark Flooring no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Ce i Flooring no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Boss Carpet One no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Rockford C: no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Tiles In Style $220,096.00 $84,242.00 $129,550.00 $14,059.00 $137,916.00 $72,751.00 $64,695.00 $248,215.00 $174,607.00 $422,822.00 $84,242.00 $100,754.00 $184,996.00 Y Y Y

Bid Opening Official: Dane blood

Bid Recording Official:

Casey Ramas




ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

IFB No. 20-35 Interior Renovations at Flinn & Kennedy Middle Schools

Due: Tuesday, April 28, 2020
Time: 2:00 PM

Flooring Work - Flooring Work - Base Bid #B5 Flinn Portion of Kennedy Portion of Flinn Portion of Kennedy Portion of

Flooring Work -Base | Flooring Work -Base [Base Bid - Kennedy|Base Bid - Kennedy| Combined Bid- Combined Bid-1st | Combined Bid-1st Combined Bid-2nd | Combined Bid-2nd Addendums Bid Bond Required
Vendor Name Bid - Flinn-B1 Bid - Flinn-B2 B3 B4 Flinn & Kennedy floor floor Total floor floor Total Received Received Documentation
Executive Painting no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Benchmark Flooring $308,900.00 $144,600.00 $388,200.00 $155,900.00 $994,800.00 $307,900.00 $387,200.00 $695,100.00 $144,200.00 $155,500.00 $299,700.00 Y Y Y
C lidated Flooring $318,117.00 $136,125.00 $428,917.00 $155,961.00 $1,039,120.00 $318,117.00 $428,917.00 $747,034.00 $136,125.00 $155,961.00 $292,086.00 Y Y Y
Boss Carpet One $297,115.00 $142,180.00 $381,085.00 $151,915.00 $972,295.00 $297,115.00 $381,085.00 $678,200.00 $142,180.00 $151,915.00 $294,095.00 Y Y Y
Rockford Carpetland $262,312.00 $181,728.00 $358,388.00 $156,237.00 $958,665.00 $261,000.00 $356,000.00 $617,000.00 $181,000.00 $155,000.00 $336,000.00 Y Y Y
Tiles In Style $260,393.00 $118,841.00 $290,432.00 $135,850.00 $805,516.00 $260,393.00 $290,432.00 $550,825.00 $118,841.00 $135,850.00 $254,691.00 Y Y Y
Bid Opening Official: Dane Y blood

Bid Recording Official:

Casey Ramas




	Painting
	Flooring

