
ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
IFB No. 21-08 Interior Renovations at Ellis School & RESA M.S.
Due: Thursday, February 11, 2021
Time:  2:00 PM

Vendor Name
Flooring Work -Base 

Bid #A1 - Ellis
Painting Work -

Base Bid #B1 - Ellis
Painting Work - Base 

Bid #B2 - RESA Alt. Bid #1 - RESA
Base Bid #B3 
Combined Bid

Ellis Portion of 
Combined Bid

RESA  Portion of 
Combined Bid

Addendums 
Received

Bid Bond 
Received

Required 
Documentation

Tiles in Styles LLC $368,265.00 $57,691.00 $37,983.00 $29,000.00 $463,939.00 $425,956.00 $37,983.00 Y Y Y

Benchmark Flooring $363,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Y Y Y

Rockford Carpetland $297,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Y Y Y

Executive Painting No Bid $66,130.00 $14,550.00 $92,810.00 $80,680.00 $66,130.00 $14,550.00 Y Y Y

Boss Carpet One $283,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Y Y Y

Painting 4 U No Bid No Bid $16,750.00 $35,450.00 $52,200.00 $0.00 $52,200.00 Y Y Y

Capital Painting & Decorating Inc. No Bid $27,340.00 $29,710.00 $66,445.00 $57,050.00 $27,340.00 $29,710.00 Y Y Y

Bid Opening Official:    Dane Youngblood

Bid Recording Official:                         Casey Ramas
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