ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid 17-21 Mechanical & Electrical Upgrades for Thurgood Marshall MS

Due: Tuesday, January 10, 2017
Time: 2:00 pm

Tamara Pugh

Martina Padilla

Vendor Name

Base Bid M

Alternate M1 Alternate M2 Total Mechanical Base Bid E Alternate E1 Total Electrical M & E Alternate Bid (Deduct) Bid Bond Addendums Received Required Documentation
Special Power, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $119,000.00 $12,750.00 $131,750.00 No Bid Yes Yes Yes
Kelso-Burnett Co No Bid No Biid No Bid No Bid $85,300.00 $5,490.00 $90,790.00 No Bid yes Yes Yes
Mechanical inc $507,000.00 $56,200.00 $1,100.00 $564,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes Yes Yes
Commercial Mechanical Inc $476,000.00 $49,000.00 $3,200.00 $528,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Yes Yes Yes
Nelson Carlson $427,741.00 $40,333.00 $1,112.00 $469,186.00 $89,877.00 $3,287.00 $93,164.00 No Bid Yes Yes Yes




