
ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS Bid Opening Official Tamara Pugh

Bid 16-37 Lincoln Middle School Mechanical and Electrical Renovations - REBID Bid Recording Official Martina Padilla

Due:  Wednesday, March 16, 2016

Time:  2:00 pm

Vendor Name Base Bid M Alternate M1 Alternate M2 Alternate M3

Total Bids & 
Alternates 

Submitted for M
Total with accepted 

alternates M Base Bid E Alternate E1 Alternate E2 Alternate E3 Alternate E4

Total Bids & 
Alternates 

Submitted for E
Total with accepted 

alternates E
M & E Alternate 

Bid (Deduct) Bid Bond
Addendums 

Received
Required 

Documentation

Commercial Mechanical Inc $965,000.00 $215,000.00 $152,000.00 $3,250.00 $1,335,250.00 $1,183,250.00 No bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid None Yes Yes Yes

Kelso Burnett No bid No bid No bid No bid $1,263,715.00 $6,560.00 $6,385.00 $288,775.00 $21,950.00 $1,587,385.00 $1,559,050.00 None Yes Yes Yes

Mechanical Inc $618,000.00 $80,600.00 $182,490.00 $3,850.00 $884,940.00 $702,450.00 No bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid None Yes Yes Yes

Special Power No bid No bid No bid No bid $968,881.00 $15,000.00 $4,500.00 $274,592.00 $30,971.00 $1,293,944.00 $1,258,473.00 None Yes Yes Yes


	Architectural 

