ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid: 21-43 Snow Removal

Due: Tuesday, June 1, 2021

Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)

Addendums Required
Vendor Name Block 7 Block 8 Block 9 Block 10 Block 11 Block 12 Received* Documentation
AA Construction Concrete $25,661.00 $34,835.00 $24,331.00 $27,421.00 $31,449.00 $11,640.00 Y Y
Snow Systems No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36,154.00 No Bid Y Y
Arctic Snow and Ice $22,777.00 $31,537.00 $26,861.00 $30,084.00 $25,939.00 $6,706.00 Y Y
LCU Properties $31,773.60 $63,569.44 $32,136.46 $51,403.08 $44,121.52 $24,276.12 Y Y

Bid Opening Official: Dane Youngblood

Bid Recording Official: Casey Ramas

*If Applicable




