ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

IFB No. 21-09 Interior Renovations at Rolling Green School & Beyer E.C.

Due: Tuesday, March 2, 2021

Time: 2:00 PM

Base Bid #A3-

Combined Bid- Rolling Green

Flooring Work -Base Base Bid #A2-Rolling| Alt. Bid #1-Rolling | Alt. Bid #2-Rolling | Beyer & Rolling Beyer Portion of Portion of Addendums | Bid Bond Required

Vendor Name Bid #A1 - Beyer Alt. Bid #1 Beyer Green Green Green Green Combined Bid Combined Bid Received Received | Doct ion
Benchmark Flooring $49,930.00 $28,930.00 $352,360.00 $52,250.00 $21,120.00 $401,500.00 $49,740.00 $351,760.00 Y Y Y
Painting 4U No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Y Y Y
Rockford Carpetland $49,500.00 $23,895.00 $333,960.00 $41,562.00 $18,970.00 $380,000.00 $49,000.00 $331,000.00 Y Y Y
Boss Carpet One $58,450.00 $12,350.00 $368,680.00 $12,500.00 $9,450.00 $425,700.00 $57,050.00 $368,650.00 Y Y Y
Nova Painting & Decorating No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Y Y Y
Bid Opening Official: Dane Y d

Bid Recording Official:

Casey Ramas




ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

IFB No. 21-09 Interior Renovations at Rolling Green School & Beyer E.C.

Due: Tuesday, March 2, 2021

Time: 2:00 PM

Base Bid #¥B3-

Combined Bid- Rolling Green
Painting Work -Base |Base Bid #B2-Rolling | Alt. Bid #1-Rolling| Beyer & Rolling Beyer Portion of Portion of
Vendor Name Bid #B1 - Beyer Green Green Green Combined Bid Combined Bid
Benchmark Flooring No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Painting 4U $9,500.00 No Bid No Bid $9,500.00 $9,500.00 No Bid
Rockford Carpetland No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Boss Carpet One No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nova Painting & Decorating $10,400.00 $146,175.00 $5,145.00 $156,575.00 $10,400.00 $146,175.00

Bid Opening Official:

Dane Youngblood

Bid Recording Official:

Casey Ramas
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	21-09 Pt. Two

