
ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid: IFB No. 22-23 HVAC & Roofing Projects at Lincoln, East, Washington and Flinn Schools
Due: Thursday, March 17, 2022
Time:  2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)

Vendor Name
Base Bid A-Washington 

HVAC
Base Bid B-1-Lincoln 

HVAC
Base Bid B-2-Lincoln 

Roofing Base Bid C-Flinn HVAC
Base Bid D-1-East 

HVAC
Base Bid D-2-East 

Roofing Combination Bid

Stenstrom Const. $15,094,000.00 $20,845,000.00 $1,761,000.00 $21,972,000.00 $19,875,000.00 $3,975,000.00 $83,000,000.00 

Helm Mechanical $11,600,000.00 $16,900,000.00 $2,300,000.00 $18,400,000.00 $18,200,000.00 $4,850,000.00 no bid

Bid Opening Official:    Dane Youngblood

Bid Recording Official:                         Casey Ramas



ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid: IFB No. 22-23 HVAC & Roofing Projects at Lincoln, East, Washington and Flinn Schools
Due: Thursday, March 17, 2022
Time:  2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)

Vendor Name Washington HVAC Portion Lincoln HVAC Portion Lincoln Roofing Portion Flinn HVAC Portion East HVAC Portion East Roofing Portion

Stenstrom Const. $15,000,000.00 $20,745,000.00 $1,761,000.00 $21,872,000.00 $19,647,000.00 3,975,000.00$                          

Helm Mechanical no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid



ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid: IFB No. 22-23 HVAC & Roofing Projects at Lincoln, East, Washington and Flinn Schools
Due: Thursday, March 17, 2022
Time:  2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)

Vendor Name Alt. Bid No. 1 Alt. Bid No. 2 Unit Price No. 1 Unit Price No. 2 Unit Price No. 3 Unit Price No. 4 Unit Price No. 5 Unit Price No. 6 Unit Price No. 7

Stenstrom Const. $1,900,000.00 $375,000.00 $850.00 $850.00 $850.00 $850.00 $850.00 $850.00 $220.00

Helm Mechanical $1,500,000.00 $355,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $250.00



ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS
Bid: IFB No. 22-23 HVAC & Roofing Projects at Lincoln, East, Washington and Flinn Schools
Due: Thursday, March 17, 2022
Time:  2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)

Vendor Name Unit Price No. 8 Unit Price No. 9 Unit Price No. 10 Unit Price No. 11 Unit Price No. 12 Unit Price No. 13 Unit Price No. 14 Unit Price No. 15
Addendums 
Received*

Bid Bond 
Received*

Required 
Documentation

Stenstrom Const. $8.00 $3.50 $12.00 $32.00 $60.00 $22.00 $18.00 $3.10 Y Y Y

Helm Mechanical $48.00 $5.00 $13.00 $35.00 $63.00 $26.00 $22.00 $4.00 Y Y Y

Bid Opening Official:    *If Applicable

Bid Recording Official:                         
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