OCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS						'			
id: IFB No. 23-27 Asbestos Abatement at E	East, Washington and Flinn S	Schools		ļl		<u> </u> '	'	<u> </u>	
Due: Tuesday, October 4, 2022				<u> </u>	+	·	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	<u> </u>	
Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)			!	<u>↓</u> ′		·	·	<u></u>	
					L	<u> </u>			
Vendor Name	A. Base Bid-East HS	Alt #1 Bid Allowance A	Alt. #2 Bid Allowance b	Total Bid (Base Bid + Bid Allowance)	Unit Price 1	Unit Price 2	Unit Price 3	Unit Price 4	
Abel Plus Services	\$57,000.00	\$55,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$137,000.00	\$14.00	\$500.00	\$1,400.00	\$1,450.00	
Husar Abatement	\$28,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$74,000.00	\$30.00	\$100.00	\$4,000.00	\$1,400.00	
Colfax Corp.	\$17,000.00	\$35,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$62,000.00	\$15.00	\$50.00	\$2,500.00	\$1,300.00	_
EHC Industries	\$26,400.00	\$36,300.00	\$23,100.00	\$85,800.00	\$66.00	\$462.00	\$1,980.00	\$1,650.00	<u> </u>
Kinsale Contracting	\$20,100.00	\$25,912.00	\$10,910.00	\$56,922.00	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$1,400.00	\$1,500.00	+
		+	·/					<u> </u>	-
	<u> </u>	<u> </u>	<u> </u>	· †		<u> </u>			
			!						
		_	ļ!	ļļ	 	ļ'		 	
	_	<u> </u>	!	ļ]	 	'	'	<u> </u>	
Bid Opening Official:	Dane Youngblood								
Bid Recording Official:	Casey Ramas				ļ				_
L					<u> </u>				

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS						
Bid: IFB No. 23-27 Asbestos Abatement at E	ast, Washington and Flinn S	chools				
Due: Tuesday, October 4, 2022						
Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)						
Vendor Name	Base Bid-Flinn MS	Alt. #1 Bid Allowance	Total Bid (Base Bid + Bid Allowance)	Unit Price 1	Unit Price 2	Unit Price 3
Abel Plus Services	\$374,000.00	\$55,000.00	\$429,000.00	\$14.00	\$1,400.00	\$1,450.00
Husar Abatement	\$84,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$124,000.00	\$30.00	\$4,000.00	\$1,400.00
Colfax Corp.	\$110,000.00	\$35,000.00	\$145,000.00	\$15.00	\$2,500.00	\$1,300.00
EHC Industries	\$184,800.00	\$36,300.00	\$221,100.00	\$66.00	\$1,980.00	\$1,650.00
Kinsale Contracting	\$123,550.00	\$25,910.00	\$149,460.00	\$25.00	\$1,400.00	\$1,500.00
Bid Opening Official:						
Bid Recording Official:						

ast, Washington and Flinn S	Schools				
Due: Tuesday, October 4, 2022 Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)					
Base Bid-Washington	Alt. #1 Bid Allowance	Total Bid (Base Bid + Bid Allowance)	Unit Price 1	Unit Price 2	Unit Price 3
No Bid					
\$282,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$322,000.00	\$30.00	\$4,000.00	\$1,400.00
\$254,000.00	\$35,000.00	\$289,000.00	\$15.00	\$2,500.00	\$1,300.00
\$283,800.00	\$36,300.00	\$320,100.00	\$66.00	\$1,980.00	\$1,650.00
\$268,826.00	\$25,912.00	\$294,738.00	\$25.00	\$1,400.00	\$1,500.00
Bid Opening Official: Bid Recording Official:					
	Base Bid-Washington No Bid \$282,000.00 \$254,000.00 \$283,800.00	No Bid \$282,000.00 \$40,000.00 \$254,000.00 \$35,000.00 \$283,800.00 \$36,300.00	No Bid Total Bid (Base Bid + Bid Allowance) \$282,000.00 \$40,000.00 \$322,000.00 \$283,800.00 \$36,300.00 \$320,100.00	Image: No Bid Alt. #1 Bid Allowance Total Bid (Base Bid + Bid Allowance) Unit Price 1 No Bid 5282,000.00 \$40,000.00 \$322,000.00 \$30.00 \$254,000.00 \$35,000.00 \$289,000.00 \$15.00 \$283,800.00 \$366,300.00 \$320,100.00 \$66.00	Image: No Bid Alt. #1 Bid Allowance Total Bid (Base Bid + Bid Allowance) Unit Price 1 Unit Price 2 No Bid

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS				
Bid: IFB No. 23-27 Asbestos Abatement at E	ast, Washington ar	nd Flinn Schools		
Due: Tuesday, October 4, 2022				
Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)				
	Addendums	Bid Bond	Required	
Vendor Name	Received*	Received*	Documentation	
Abel Plus Services	Y	Y	Y	
Husar Abatement	Y	Y	Y	
Colfax Corp.	Y	Y	Y	
EHC Industries	Y	Y	Y	
Kinsale Contracting	Y	Y	Y	
Bid Opening Official:		*If Applicable		
Bid Recording Official:				